
 

 
UFC Issues Statement Regarding Le and Johnson Antitrust Settlement Ruling 

 
 
LAS VEGAS, JULY 31, 2024 – UFC, part of TKO Group Holdings (NYSE: TKO), issued the following 
statement in response to yesterday’s ruling on the UFC antitrust settlement regarding the Le and 
Johnson class action lawsuits: 
 
We obviously disagree with this ruling and believe it disregards the expertise of counsel from both 
sides, as well as that of an accomplished and expert mediator – all of whom have decades of 
experience in antitrust case law.  
 
It prevents the athletes from receiving what they have argued is in their best interest and unwinds an 
extensively negotiated settlement that, in the plaintiffs’ counsel’s own words, ‘would far surpass the 
typical antitrust class action settlement’ and ‘is an excellent result for the Settlement Classes by all 
traditional measures.’  
 
Additionally, by taking the unusual step of denying the settlement at this preliminary approval stage, 
the Judge is also denying the athletes their right to be heard during this pivotal moment in the case.  
 
As we have said throughout this process, we believe strongly in the merits of our cases and are 
evaluating all our options – including, without limitation, an appeal – and have initiated discussions 
with plaintiffs’ counsel who have expressed a willingness to engage in separate settlement 
discussions for the Le and Johnson cases. 
  
 
 

### 
 
About UFC 
UFC is the world’s premier mixed martial arts organization (MMA), with more than 700 million fans 
and approximately 266 million social media followers. The organization produces more than 40 live 
events annually in some of the most prestigious arenas around the world while broadcasting to over 
900 million households across more than 170 countries. UFC’s athlete roster features the world’s best 
MMA athletes representing more than 80 countries. The organization’s digital offerings include UFC 
FIGHT PASS®, one of the world’s leading streaming services for combat sports. UFC is part of TKO 
Group Holdings (NYSE: TKO) and is headquartered in Las Vegas, Nevada. For more information, 
visit UFC.com and follow UFC at Facebook.com/UFC and @UFC on X, Snapchat, Instagram, and 
TikTok: @UFC. 
 
 
About TKO 
TKO Group Holdings, Inc. (NYSE: TKO) is a premium sports and entertainment company. TKO 
includes UFC, the world’s premier mixed martial arts organization, and WWE, the recognized global 
leader in sports entertainment. Together, our organizations reach more than 1 billion households in 
approximately 210 countries and territories, and we organize more than 300 live events year-round, 
attracting more than two million fans. TKO is majority owned by Endeavor Group Holdings, Inc. 
(NYSE: EDR), a global sports and entertainment company. 
 
 
Website Disclosure 
Investors and others should note that TKO announces material financial and operational information 
to its investors using press releases, SEC filings and public conference calls and webcasts, as well as 
its Investor Relations site at investor.tkogrp.com. TKO may also use its website as a distribution 
channel of material information about the Company. In addition, you may automatically receive email 
alerts and other information about TKO, UFC and WWE when you enroll your email address by 
visiting the “Investor Email Alerts” option under the Resources tab on investor.tkogrp.com. 
 
  



Forward-Looking Statements 
This press release contains forward-looking statements within the meaning of the Private Securities 
Litigation Reform Act of 1995. We intend such forward-looking statements to be covered by the safe 
harbor provisions for forward-looking statements contained in Section 27A of the Securities Act of 
1933, as amended, and Section 21E of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, as amended. All 
statements in this press release that do not relate to matters of historical fact should be considered 
forward-looking statements, including statements regarding actions the Company may take following 
the court’s ruling and potential settlement of the Le and Johnson cases. The words “believe,” “may,” 
“will,” “estimate,” “potential,” “continue,” “anticipate,” “intend,” “expect,” “could,” “would,” “project,” 
“plan,” “target,” and similar expressions are intended to identify forward-looking statements, though 
not all forward-looking statements use these words or expressions. These forward-looking statements 
are based on management’s current expectations. These statements are neither promises nor 
guarantees and involve known and unknown risks, uncertainties and other important factors that may 
cause actual results, performance or achievements to be materially different from what is expressed 
or implied by the forward-looking statements, including, but not limited to the section entitled “Risk 
Factors” in TKO’s Annual Report on Form 10-K for the fiscal year ended December 31, 2023, as any 
such factors may be updated from time to time in the Company’s other filings with the SEC, 
accessible on the SEC’s website at www.sec.gov and TKO’s investor relations site 
at investor.tkogrp.com. Forward-looking statements speak only as of the date they are made and, 
except as may be required under applicable law, TKO undertakes no obligation to update or revise 
any forward-looking statements, whether as a result of new information, future events or otherwise. 
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